PROPOSAL TABULATION SHEET

NEW TRANSPORTATION FACILITY

DICKINSON L.S.D.

BID DATE: TUESDAY, 20 APRIL 2010 @ 2:00 PM

BASS CF JORDAN DYAD GAEKE

ITEM BARTLETT - COCKE CONSTRUCTION CONSTRUCTION DRYMALLA CONSTRUCTION EMJ CORPORATION CONSTRUCTION GAMMA
PROPOSAL BOND (AD) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
FELONY CONVICTION NOTIFICATION (AK) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
EVALUATION WAIVER (AL) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
CONFLICT OF INTEREST (AM) Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
ADDENDA 1 thru 8 Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
BASE PROPOSAL AMOUNT $ 7,652,000.00 | $ 7,169,000.00 | $ 7,475,000.00 | $ 7,532,000.00 | $ 7,649,000.00 | $ 7,400,000.00 NO BID $ 7,784,000.00
BASE PROPOSAL RANK
ALTERNATE NO. 1 .
ADDITIONAL BUS PARKING $ 307,000.00 | $ 313,000.00 | $ 290,000.00 | $ 330,000.00 352,000.00 | $ 342,000.00 $ 339,000.00
TOTAL PROPOSAL AMOUNT
CALENDAR DAYS 250 275 270 300 290 270 310

CALENDAR DAYS RANK




PROPOSAL TABULATION SHEET
NEW TRANSPORTATION FACILIT
DICKINSON 1.S.D.

BID DATE: TUESDAY, 20 APRIL 2010 .

HOLLIDAY STERLING STEWART TEAL
ITEM G.T.T., INC. BUILDERS JAMAIL & SMITH MINER-DEDERICK RESICOM, INC. STRUCTURES BUILDERS CONSTRUCTION

PROPOSAL BOND (AD) Y Y Y Y
FELONY CONVICTION NOTIFICATION (AK) Y Y Y Y
EVALUATION WAIVER (AL) Y Y Y Y
CONFLICT OF INTEREST (AM) Y Y Y Y
ADDENDA 1 thru 8 Y Y ' Y Y
BASE PROPOSAL AMOUNT $ 7,899,000.00 NO BID NO BID $ 7,570,000.00 NO BID $ 7,480,000.00 NO BID $ 7,517,000.00
BASE PROPOSAL RANK
ALTERNATE NO. 1
ADDITIONAL BUS PARKING $ 315,000.00 327,000.00 $ 320,000.00 $ 335,000.00
TOTAL PROPOSAL AMOUNT
CALENDAR DAYS 365 315 269 210
CALENDAR DAYS RANK




